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A COMMUNICATION FROM THE 
RETIRING PRESIDENT 

May I take this opportunity to express 
my appreciation to each and every one for 
the earnest and sincere cooperation ex- 
tended me during this rather busy year. 
As with you, the president of the Rural 
Sociological Society has had a f u l l  schedule 
of work over and above his official duties 
to the Society. Probably both that work 
and his duties as president have suffered. 
However, an effort has been made to do an 
acceptable job at both. To serve as an 
officer of the Rural Sociological Society is 
more of a privilege than an honor, and I 
have accepted it as such, as well as an 
expression of the confidence of the Society 
in me as one of its members. 

It was your retiring president, as a mem- 
ber of a committee on organization, who, on 
December 28, 1937 (I quote the date from 
memory, as none of the records or corres- 
pondence shows it in writing), introduced 
a minority resolution which resulted in the 
birth of the Society. Not one of the mem- 
bers of that committee would sign the 
minority report with me. However, certain 
old "war horses" of the Society who, along 
with me, saw possibilities in the future for 
a Rural Sociological Society came in num- 
bers to my support. In fact, I had been 
placed on that committee because it was 
known generally that I had been advocat- 
ing the formation of a society of our own 
for several years. It  was known, too, that 
there was strong opposition to it. It  was a 
case of men who were then young, at least 
younger than they are now, loading a meet- 
ing while the elder brethren slept on their 
own rights. It  is always young men who 
win the crucial issues. Old men may de- 
clare the war and dictate the terms of 
peace, but young men fight, and young men 
die for the causes in which they believe. 
Sometimes they win. December 28, 1937, 
was a day of victory for young men. There 
are others yet to be won. 

We have had a good year in 1953, despite 
some discouragements. More remains to 
be done than has been accomplished. I 
trust that young men will support my suc- 
cessor, Nate Whetten, and his successor, 
BiU Sewell. They are tops, but they will 
need our help. So will their successors 
after them. 

I foresee a rural society which we cannot 
study without new concepts, new units of 
measurement, new ideas of basic rural 
groups, and new senses and ideas of rela- 

tionships between rural people and other 
human groups. We must see agricultural 
society in the light of a new function in 
the total society. It remains for others 
than my generation to derive the formulas 
and the coeEcients by which that society 
can be interpreted to the world. 

Never cease looking for the unexpected, 
despising not the old nor fearing the new. 
Each in its selfsame manner has its part in 
the evolution of human society. The things 
which we know are never true for a much 
longer time than it took us to learn them. 
In the future, social change will be so rapid 
that what we learn will have become obso- 
lete before we are sure of it. Such is the 
prospect which we must face with a realis- 
tic determination. Carry on! 

ANNUAL MEETINGS OF 
THE RURAL SOCIOLOGICAL socmm 

Minutes of ihe Business Meefing, Sepfem- 
ber 4. 1953. Oklahoma Agricultural and Me- 
chanical College. Siillwater. Oklahoma The 
meeting was called to order at 4:00 p. m., 
by Otis Durant Duncan, president. Min- 
utes of the August 3lSeptember 1, 1952, 
meetings as published in the December, 
1952, issue of Rural Sociology were accept- 
ed as printed. 

A report was given on the preferences of 
members, as expressed in a mail inquiry, 
as to time and place of the 1954 meetings. 
It was moved, seconded, and carried that 
the 1954 annual meeting of the Society be 
held on the campus of the University of 
Illinois, just prior to the meetings of the 
American Sociological Society, with one 
day of joint meetings overlapping. 

The Committee on Elections, consisting of 
Seth W. Russell (chairman), Renee Abram- 
son, and Francena Nolan, reported. The 
following candidates were elected officers 
of the Rural Sociological Society for the 
coming year: president-elect, William H. 
Sewell; vice-president, Margaret Jarman 
Hagood; member of the Executive Com- 
mittee, Olaf F. Larson; member of the 
Editorial Board of Ru~a1 Sociology, Homer 
L. Hitt; Committee on Research, J. Allan 
Beegle; Committee on Extension, Harold E. 
Smith; Committee on Teaching, Leland B. 
Tate. 

The request of the Department of Town 
and Country Church, National Council of 
Churches, that the Rural Sociological So- 
ciety support a request that President 

La 


































